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AvS  – International Trusted Advi-
sors: Prof. Windt, Prof. Ferkel, 

your goals are very ambitious. By 
2026, you want the SMS group not 
only to be the world‘s leading supplier 
of climate-neutral production proces-
ses in the metal industry, but also to 
have repositioned the company from 
being a traditional mechanical engi-
neering company to become a com-
plete solutions service provider. Steel 
production, for which you build ever-
ything from blast furnaces to rolling 
mills and strip processing lines in your 
core business, unfortunately holds 
the inglorious first place as the largest 
industrial CO2 producer today. Ensu-
ring greater climate protection here 
sounds like a mammoth task.

PROF. DR. KATJA WINDT: That 
is one of the reasons why I started at 
SMS three and a half years ago: The 
challenge is high and the task extreme-
ly exciting. With its technological inno-
vations and as a full-range supplier in 
the metal industry, SMS has always led 
the competitive field, and has done so 
for 150 years. Now we are systemati-
cally implementing digitalization along 
the value chain in metal production 
and processing, and are opening up 
new performance and business poten-
tial. Our service areas Electrics & Auto-
mation, Digitization and Technical Ser-
vice are taking a combined approach. 
Data is generated in our sensor and 
automation systems, and then analy-
zed by our process and digital experts 
using AI algorithms. By recognizing 
new patterns from parameter combi-
nations, we can predict, for example, 
when a component of a system will fail 
and adjust the maintenance cycle ac-
cordingly. 
This gives us new levers for more ef-
ficient material use, but also for grea-

ter climate protection. Our customers 
are faced with highly complex issues: 
Already in the next decade, manufac-
turers want and must be able to pro-
duce steel in a climate-neutral way and 
process it in a resource-saving way. It 
is no longer just a question of cost sa-
vings. Increasingly, we are helping to 
answer questions about how our cus-
tomers can offer their clients better 
and more sustainable products. We 
no longer simply provide the machines 
or systems. We use the entire innova-
tion portfolio of mechanics, automa-
tion and digitization combined with 
our consulting expertise and become, 
so to speak, temporary colleagues for 
our customers. By using data analy-
tics, we gain a better understanding 
of the complex interdependencies and 
can thus offer performance-oriented 
business models. In this way, we help 
our customers to increase the perfor-
mance of their plants. This also applies 
to CO2 reduction, for example, through 
our energy application. In addition, 
customers are now explicitly asking for 
digital software products and services. 
This area is becoming increasingly im-
portant for us.

PROF. DR. HANS FERKEL: Mam-
moth task is a good phrase. I came on 
board two years ago, by the way, preci-
sely because SMS, as a family business, 
has shown staying power. When the 
wind blows cold and hard, we don‘t pa-
nic and look at the figures, but take our 
time, think things through and discuss 
them with great openness. And then, 
above all, we don‘t just talk, but also 
implement our plan. One example: In 
the booming electromobility sector, 
battery manufacturers and carmakers 
are looking for ways to recycle batte-
ries and, in particular, to recover the 
valuable metals they contain – and to 

do so as far as possible without cau-
sing new emissions such as CO2. We 
decided to enter the new strategic area 
of recycling and this year we put our 
money where our mouth is. With Pri-
mobius, a joint venture with the Aus-
tralian company Neometals, we will 
start the first pilot plant this year and 
recycle up to 1,000 tons of lithium-ion 
batteries per year for our customers in 
the first stage. 

For a fully automated factory or 
remote maintenance at a cus-

tomer‘s site, you will probably have 
good software developers at SMS and 
need many more. How do you attract 
young digital experts to a formerly 
traditional plant manufacturer? And 
how do you get the more hands-on 
engineers to work hand in hand with 
virtuoso data specialists?  

WINDT: We have been working 
intensively on how we can attract the 
best digital experts. All companies are 
fighting for good software developers, 
who are in short supply. However, 
we have found that as a family-ow-
ned company, with our sophisticated 
products and above all our role as an 
enabler of sustainable production pro-
cesses, we are also attractive to many 
younger applicants. We also take un-
usual approaches to recruiting and 
were represented at the Gamescom 
computer games fair in Cologne, for 
example, in order to reach our target 
group. In discussions with developers, 
we made it clear that we can not only 
improve the product enormously with 
the data from the many sensors in 
our plants, but that the result of our 
work is also very real and tangible. It 
is perhaps also more meaningful than 
programming the next entertainment 
computer game. 
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We will see a new competition for locations,  

a new battle to attract companies  
that want to operate in a climate-neutral  
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FERKEL: Of course, we have op-
timized plants and processes before; 
we know our plants inside out and 
can model and calculate the proces-
ses that take place in them. Conside-
rable amounts of data are generated 
when operating the plants. Now the 
young digital colleagues come along 
and want to work magic with the num-
bers. But they first have to learn how 
to compile the right numbers, correla-
te them and then interpret them cor-
rectly. How exactly does the process 
work? What is the temperature control 
like? What do I have to do to ensure 
that quality really comes out and the 
result is economical? But it is precisely 
in this constructive cooperation that 
new insights and solutions are created 
for our customers. 

WINDT: It is essential that the 
teams learn from each other. Since we 
also want to digitize our internal pro-
cesses more and more, it is important 
that the digital colleagues communica-
te what digitization can do.

That probably sounds easier than 
it is. Does it work?
FERKEL: The transfer of know-

ledge and the exchange between old 
and young  – that works quite well. 
Colleagues learn a lot from each other 
and broaden their horizons.
Windt: I‘d say that it works sometimes 
this way and sometimes that, but we‘re 
getting better all the time.

What is your recipe for success 
in ensuring that this cultural 

change and mutual learning succeed 
and that both teams play as one team 
and win?

WINDT: Listening is important 
on both sides, getting involved in the 
respective new territory and unders-
tanding how that opens up new possi-
bilities in my world. Then it‘s essential 
to recognize the successes achieved 
together – even the small ones. If ever-
yone wants to reach the summit indivi-
dually, it‘s a long way. It already helps 
when the first and second intermedia-
te stages are completed and everyone 
sees: It can be done. The recognition 
must come above all from the mana-
gers, then a culture of appreciation 
and confidence grows and the belief 
that we can do it, precisely because 
we bring different strengths to bear on 
the task.
For our own digital transformation at 
SMS, we have tried out a new concept 
that is proving very successful. We 
have appointed Digital Ambassadors 
and looked for volunteers to train ot-
her colleagues in digital topics. To this 
end, we provide them with a quota of 
hours during which they can act as 
ambassadors. This has been very well 
received and provides scope for ex-
change, innovation and learning.

The voluntary nature of the program 
is particularly important  – it is not a 
traditional assignment to a specialist 
department. It‘s self-initiated and in-
formal  – in the coffee lounge or kit-
chen, as a podcast, in virtual mee-
tings or self-created learning spaces, 
and across departmental boundaries. 
That‘s exactly what we want to achieve.

FERKEL: For me, mutual appre-
ciation and the joint recognition of 
successes are important so that the 
generations can learn from each ot-
her. I remember a party before Coro-
na, there were these two very different 
generations, the colleagues with often 
more than 25 years of professional ex-
perience and then the young colleagu-
es, many not even 30 years old. It was 
interesting to see how they exchanged 
views on the changes brought about 
by digitization. That really fascinated 
me. Once the fear of contact has been 
overcome, topics beyond professiona-
lism are also addressed. That creates 
the necessary trust to get things on the 
table that aren‘t going well. In the end, 
this not only leads to better cooperati-
on, but also to fewer mistakes, because 
all and very different aspects – which 
can include highly relevant informa-
tion – are taken into account.
Of course, diversity is also crucial for 
good collaboration, and in our case 
especially a higher proportion of wo-
men. As a traditional plant manufactu-
rer, we still have to do better here and 
attract more women to our industry.

WINDT: The leadership team is 
indeed crucial for successful digital 
transformation. All of us together in 
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neutral and sustainable metal industry. 
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14,000 people worldwide and generates 
sales of more than 2.7 billion euros.



the leadership team have the same un-
derstanding of what we want to achie-
ve and, above all, why we want to do 
it. We are responsible for creating the 
framework for change. This must be 
comprehensible so that we can then 
involve the next management levels 
and work together to achieve the goal.

Let’s come to your ambitious strate-
gy to decarbonize the steel indus-

try with SMS. As a full-range supplier 
and innovation leader, you have all 
the technological ingredients at hand. 
What are the special challenges?

FERKEL: Our customers have set 
themselves very ambitious climate tar-
gets and want to minimize emissions 
along the entire value chain. This invol-
ves the use of green hydrogen instead 
of coking coal, but also greater resour-
ce efficiency. Many steel mills are start-
ing their transformation as existing 
plants are depreciated over several de-
cades. Here we help with roadmaps on 
how to integrate the most sustainable 
product solution when replacement 
investments are needed for the steel 
mill. But there are also greenfield pro-
jects such as in northern Sweden. Here, 
the first and largest steel mill is being 
built, which will produce five million 
tons of green steel per year - based on 
green hydrogen and therefore comple-
tely CO2-neutral. Here we can make full 
use of our innovation portfolio.
However, this is still a single lighthou-
se project. The political framework for 
a rapid ramp-up of hydrogen produc-
tion, the expansion of renewable ener-
gies and the necessary infrastructure 
is still lacking. We also have an extre-
mely competitive situation: companies 
for climate-neutral mobility, from the 
electricity industry, the chemical in-
dustry - they all need green electricity 
or hydrogen in the medium and long 
term. And then, last but not least, the 
end-consumer for cars or homes.

WINDT: And CO2 that has previ-
ously been captured from industrial 
processes is also becoming a sought-
after raw material, for example in the 
production of climate-neutral fuels. 
Together with green hydrogen and 

CO2, our customers can produce e-ke-
rosene in several steps to de-carbonize 
air traffic or e-gasoline for heavy-duty 
transport. We have acquired a stake in 
the company Sunfire, whose innovati-
ve high-temperature electrolysis pro-
cess enables the production of such 
new fuels directly connected to a steel 
mill. This is industrial photosynthesis, 
so to speak.
We will see a new competition for lo-
cations, a new battle to attract compa-
nies that want to operate in a clima-
te-neutral and sustainable way. In the 
past, it was good roads or attractive 
site financing or, in our steel industry, 
deposits of coal that attracted compa-
nies. Tomorrow, it will be reliable on-
site infrastructure with green power 
and hydrogen, as well as supplies of 
CO2 sources. This is what policy ma-
kers in Germany and Europe must be 
prepared for if a future climate-neutral 
industry is to be maintained with va-
lue creation and jobs. Germany needs 
to act quickly now so that we do not 
lose our good position in international 
competition when it comes to sustai-
nability.

Prof. Windt, Prof. Ferkel, thank you 
for the interview.
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